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printed on demand. Paperback. 22 pages. Original publisher:
Washington, D. C. : U. S. Environmental Protection Agency,
Solid Waste and Emergency Response, 1999 OCLC Number:
(OCoLC)76165517 Subject: Hazardous wastes -- Law and
legislation -- United States. Excerpt: . . . vehicle. qxd 6 17 99 2: 34
PM Page 13 Radiator Repair PROCESS Zinc chloride ( coolant ),
chlorinated solvents, and lead solder. Wastes Generated D001,
D002, D008, and F002. Possible RCRA Waste Codes Collect and
reclaim solvents. Store them separately, do not contaminate.
Potential Recycling, Ship hazardous waste using a registered
transporter to a hazardous waste TSDF forTreatment, and
treatment and disposal. Disposal MethodsAdjust process to
reduce solvent use ( e. g. , use compressed air to blow out
residual Potential Pollution alkaline solution after removing
from boil-out tank, then collect and return to tank ). Prevention
Methods Employ lead-free or reduced lead solder. Use a
recyclable type of radiator fluid and collect flushing liquid for
reuse. Tire Replacement PROCESS Scrap tires. Wastes
Generated None. Possible RCRA Waste Codes Ship scrap tires
using a registered hauler to a scrap tire processor, such as a
licensedenergy recovery facility, or a reuse, retreading...
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